
Submodule 6.1 - The use of mindfulness and meditation in the grieving process

Mindfulness and meditation are powerful tools to accompany grieving individuals in their 
process of emotional healing. The practice of mindfulness allows individuals to reconnect 
with the present moment, to observe their thoughts and emotions without judgment, and to 
cultivate an attitude of acceptance and self-kindness. In the context of grief, mindfulness can 
help people navigate through the various stages of sorrow, offering them a safe space to 
explore and express their emotions.

Mindfulness meditation encourages grieving individuals to focus their attention on their 
breathing, their body sensations and their immediate environment. By focusing on the 
present moment, they can gradually detach themselves from obsessive thoughts and 
ruminations related to their loss. Jon Kabat-Zinn, pioneer of mindfulness meditation, 
emphasizes that "mindfulness allows us to be present in our life, moment after moment, 
whether it is pleasant or unpleasant, easy or difficult." This ability to be fully present can 
help grieving individuals better manage their emotional distress and find moments of 
respite in their sorrow.

Regular practice of mindfulness meditation has been associated with a reduction in 
symptoms of depression, anxiety, and post-traumatic stress, which are common reactions in 
grieving individuals. A study carried out by Cacciatore and Flint (2012) revealed that 
participants in an 8-week mindfulness meditation program experienced a significant 
decrease in their emotional distress and an improvement in their quality of life after losing 
a loved one. Participants reported a greater ability to cope with their grief, as well as an 
increased feeling of connection with their surroundings and with the deceased person.



As a GRIEF COACH, you can incorporate mindfulness and meditation into your grief 
coaching sessions in several ways. You can start by teaching your clients simple conscious 
breathing techniques, inviting them to focus their attention on their breath and to observe 
the physical sensations that accompany it. You can also guide them in "body scan" 
meditations, where they are asked to explore different parts of their body with kind 
attention, progressively releasing physical and emotional tensions. Over time, you can 
introduce more grief-specific meditations, such as self-compassion meditation or gratitude 
meditation for moments shared with the deceased.

It is important to note that the practice of mindfulness and meditation does not aim to 
eliminate or suppress painful emotions related to grief, but rather to welcome them with 
kindness and explore them without judgment. As psychologist Kristin Neff points out, 
"mindfulness allows us to recognize our suffering without identifying with it, and to 
respond to our pain with compassion rather than with harsh self-criticism." By cultivating 
this attitude of kindness towards oneself, grieving individuals can gradually transform their 
relationship to their grief and find a new meaning in their life after loss.

By incorporating mindfulness and meditation into your grief coaching practice, you offer 
your clients valuable tools to navigate through the emotional challenges of the grieving 
process. You help them cultivate a mindful presence to their emotions, develop a healthier 
relationship with their grief, and find moments of inner peace in the most difficult times. By 
accompanying them in this practice, you enable them to develop emotional resilience that 
will support them throughout their journey towards healing and personal growth.

Remember that every grieving individual is unique, and that the practice of mindfulness and 
meditation may not be suitable for everyone. It is essential to adapt your approach 
according to the needs, preferences, and beliefs of each client, and to guide them with 
compassion and respect in their exploration of these tools. By creating a safe and supportive 
space for the practice of mindfulness and meditation, you provide your clients with valuable 
support in their grieving and emotional healing process.

Key points to remember:

1. Mindfulness and meditation are powerful tools for supporting grieving individuals in 
their emotional healing process, by allowing them to reconnect with the present moment, 
observe their thoughts and emotions without judgment, and cultivate an attitude of 
acceptance and self-kindness.

2. Regular practice of mindfulness meditation has been linked to a reduction in symptoms of 
depression, anxiety and post-traumatic stress, which are common reactions in grieving 
individuals.

3. GRIEF COACHES can incorporate mindfulness and meditation into their grief coaching 



sessions by teaching simple conscious breathing techniques, guiding "body scan" 
meditations, and introducing grief-specific meditations such as self-compassion or gratitude 
meditation.

4. The practice of mindfulness and meditation is not aimed at eliminating or repressing 
painful emotions connected to grief, but rather at welcoming them with kindness and 
exploring them without judgment, allowing grieving individuals to develop a healthier 
relationship with their grief.

5. It is essential to tailor the approach to mindfulness and meditation based on the needs, 
preferences, and beliefs of each client, and guiding them with compassion and respect in 
their exploration of these tools, creating a safe and supportive space for their practice.


